STATE OF VERMONT

1989

VERMONT FIRE PREVENTION
AND BUILDING CODE

Madeleine M. Kunin, Jeanne VanVlandren, Commissioner
Governor Department of Labor and Industry






State of Vermont
Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code

Table of Contents

SECTION 1 TITLE 1
SECTION 2  INTENT OF CODE 1
SECTION3  SCOPE AND CONSTRUCTION 1
SECTION4  APPLICATION FOR A CONSTRUCTION PERMIT 2
SECTIONS5  FEES FOR A CONSTRUCTION PERMIT 2
SECTION-6  USE AND OCCUPANCY PERMIT 3
SECTION7  RESPONSIBILITY OF THE OWNER 3
SECTION 8  DUTIES OF THE OWNER 3
SECTIONS9  POWERS OF THE COMMISSIONER OF
LABOR AND INDUSTRY 4
SECTION10  ADOPTION OF NATIONALLY RECOGNIZED
‘ SAFETY STANDARDS 4
SECTION 11 VARIANCE PROCEDURE 17
SECTION12  REQUEST FOR RECONSIDERATION 18
SECTION 13  ADVISORY BOARD 18
SECTION 14  MUNICIPAL ENFORCEMENT
AND COORDINATION 18
SECTION 15  EFFECTIVE DATES 19

APPENDIX 1 Minimum Snow Load Map
APPENDIX 2 Definitions

ATTACHMENT 1 Examples That Should Be Included
in Plans and and Specifications

ATTACHMENT 2 Construction Permit Application

1988 supplement; The BOCA National Fire Prevention Code, 1987 edition and ifs 1988 supplement; and, The

Note: These rules should be read in conjunction with: The BOCA National Building Code, 1987 edition and its
Life Safety Code, 1938 edition.







State of Vermont

Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code 1989

SECTION 1.
TITLE

These rufes are adopted under 21 V.S.A,
Scctions 252 and 262 and shall be known and cited as
the 1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building
Code.

SECTION 2.
INTENT OF CODE

It is the intent of this Code to make rules
regarding the construction of buildings, maintenance
and opcration of premises, and prevention of fires
and removal of fire hazards and to prescribe stan-
dards necessary to protect the public, employces and
property against harm arising out of or likely to arise
oul af fire,

SECTION 3.
SCOPE AND CONSTRUCTION

(2) The 1989 Vermont I'ire Prevention and
Building Code shall apply and control all matters
concerning the construction, atteration, addition,
repair, removal, demolition, use, location, occupancy
and maintenance of all public buildings and premises
and to all manulacturing, storage, handling, transpor-
tation and use of hazardous, explosive and [lammable
petroleum products, For purposes of this Code, the
words public building, premise, structure, or any part
thereof, shall be construed to be the same as that
prescribed for “public building” in Title 21 V.S.A,
Sec. 251(a) and “condominium” as preseribed in Title
21 V.5.A, Sec. 251(d). The definitions for “public
building™ and “condominium” are included in
Apnendix 2.

{(h) The 1989 Vermont Fire Prevention anid
Building Code shall apply (o new and exisling
buildings, premises, and their use, occupancy and
maintcnance except that existing or new buildings,
premises and their nse, occupancy and mainicnance
not in strict compliance with the material {erms of
this Code shall be permitied when, in the opinion of
the Commissioner of Labor and Industry or a duly
authorized representative, the exceptions do not
constitute a distinct hazard to life or property.

{c) Nothing contained in the 1989 Vermant
Fire Prevention and Building Code shall be con-
strued as applying to the transportation of any article
or thing shipped under the jurisdiction of and in
compliance with the regulations prescribed by the
United States Department of Transgportation, or the
Vermon{ Agency of Transportation with respect to
placarding, nor as applying to the military lorces of
the United States.

(d) Nothing contained herein shall be
construed to limil the authority of the Commissioner
of Labor and Tndustry to establish priorities for
enforcing these rules based on the relative risks to
persons and property from fire of particular types of
premises.

(e) In the event any parl or pravision of this
Code is held to be illegal, this shall not have the
elfect of making void or illegal any of the other parts
or pirovisions of this Code,

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code

Page 1



SECTION 4.
APPLICATION FOR A
CONSTRUCTION PERMIT

(1) Before a butlding or premise or an
addition Lo a building or premise is construcied or
erected, and before a building or premise is aliered or
relocated, or building equipment is installed therein, a
construction permit shali be obtained from the
Connmissioner or a duly amhorized representative, To
obtain a construction permit an application for a
construction permit shall he submitted 1o the Com-
missioner ar 4 duly antharized representative, Plans
and specifications relating to the work and eguipment
under consideration shall accompany (he application
uniess specilically waived by (he Commissioner or a
July authorized representative, based on the size, vse,
occupancy or complexity of the work. No plans or
specifications need o be submitied [or minor repairs.
Applications lor a consleuction permit are available
Mrom any office of the Department of Labor and
Tndustry. An application form is inctuded in Atlach-
ment 2.

(b) Plans required under this Code shall be
drawn 10 scale and shall be sufficiently clear,
comprehensive, detailed and legible when submitled
(0 the Commissioner or a duly authorized representa-
tive so that, wgether wills any accompanying specili-
cations and dat, a person who is compelent in such
malters can readily deicrmine whether or not the
proposed building, addition, or alleration, and al
proposed baiiding equipment will conform to this
Code. xamples ol information that should he
included in the plans and specifications are included
in Atlachiment b

(¢} An application for a construction permit
shall be determined to be complete prior (o assign-
ment {or review.

() The Commissioner or a duly aulhorized
representative shall review the application for &
construction permit and the pians and specilications
where applicable and shall issuc or deny the applica-
tion within a reasonahle time after filing. The
Commissioner or a duly authorized representative
may require additional information belore issuing or
denying the appiication for a construction permit and
may issue a conditional construction permit under
specilicd erms and conditions, Conditions of the
permit or reasons for deniaf of the permit shall be
ransmitied 1o the applicaut in writing,

(¢) The Commisstoner or a duly authorized
representative may provide consultation or prelimi-
nary plan review for proposed construction when
deemed warranied by the significance or complexity
of the project.

() The construction permit shati be posted
on the site of operations in a conspicuous place open

. 10 public view during the entirc time of construction

and wntil completion ol the projcct,

(g} Any information necessarily required by
the Commissioner or a duly authorized representative
which is identificd as conlidential, proprictary or
trade secret, shatt be so treated,

SECTION 5.
FEESFORA
CONSTRUCTION PERMIT

(1) A properly completed application
submitted for a construction permit shall be accompa-
nied by the appropriate fee as established according
1o Title 21 V.S.A. See. 252(c). The application for a
construciion permit including plans and specifica-
tions will not be reviewed unti! the appropriate fee
has been paid.

(1) The fee due based on the total valuation
of the construction work to be done is $3.00 per cach
$1,000.00 of construction valuation.

(¢) For purposes ol assisting the Commis-
sioner or a duly autharized representative in deter-
mining the validity of estimated valuation, reference
may be made to the BOCA Building Valuation Data
Report published by the Building Officials and Code
Administrators (BOCA) International, Inc,

{d) No fee shall be charged for the benefit of
the state if the municipality in which the building or
structure is located has assumed responsibility for
reviewing and approving construction plans and
drawings pursuant to 21 V.8.A, Scc. 256,

fe) In the case of abandonment or discon-
tinuance of a building project invelving a construc-
tion permit fee greater than $150 the construction
permit fee may be refunded upon wrilten request to
the Commissioner, prarated on construction work,
services, reviews, and inspections conducted prior 1o
such abandonment,

Page 2

1989 Vermound Fire Prevention and Building Code



SECTION 6.
USE AND OCCUPANCY
PERMIT

{(a) A building or structure hereafter erected
shall not be used or occupied in whole or in part until
a permit for use and occupancy shall have been
issucd by the Commissioner or a daly authorized
representative.

() A building or structure herecafter cn-
larged, exiended or altered 10 change {rom one use
group e another or o a different nse within the same
use group in whale or in part, and a butlding or
structure hercafier altered for which a permit for use
and occnpancy has not been heretofore issued, shall
not be occupied or used until the permit shail have
been issucd by the Commissioner or a duly author-
ized representative.

(¢) Belore & use and occupancy permit is
issued:

1) A [linal inspection shall be conducted
by the Commissioner or duly author-
ized representative and the results
shal be given ta the owner in writing,
or;

2) At the discretion of the Commissioner
or a duly authorized representative, a
Complction Cerlificate shall be filed
by the owner or a duly authorized
represeniative certilying that the
construction work was compleled in
accordance with the approved plans
and specifications,

(d) Before a use and occupancy permit is
issued, a building or structure and the building
systems installed therein shall be in substantial
compliance with all other codes administered by the
Department of Labor and Industry.

(¢) The Commissioner or a duly authorized
representative may issue o lemporary use and
oceupancy permit for a building or structure, or part
thereof, before the entire work covered by the
construction permit shall have been completed,
providing that such portion or portions may be
occupied salely prior to full completion of the

building or strocture without endangering life or
public wellare.

() The Commissioner or a duly authorized
representative may issue a temporary vse and
occupancy permit, and assign dates for abatement of
violations noted at the time of the final inspectlion
provided that such violations do not endanger the
public safcly.

(g) The owner or a duly anthorized represen-
1ative shall provide written notice to the Comntis-
sioner or a duly authorized representative fifleen days
prior to the desired use and occupaney ol the building
or struclure.,

{h) The Use and Occupancy Permit shall be
posted on the site of operation in a conspicuous place
open (o public view,

SECTION 7.
RESPONSIBILITY OF THE
OWNER

Neither the issuance of a conslruction permil
nor inspections made by the Commissioner or a duly
authorized representative shall in any way relieve the
owner of the public building or premise from full
responsibility for having the work performed in
accordance with réquirements of this Code.

SECTION 8.
DUTIES OF THE OWNER

The owner of the building or structare, or a
duly authorized representative shall;

(a) Not build or maintain or cause Lo be buill
or maintained any public building or premise which
is unsafe or is likely to be unsafe (o persons or
property.

(b) Obscrve these rules on all public
buildings or premises under his/her control.

{c} Allow the Commissioner or a duly
authorized representative to enter any public build-
ings or premises at any reasonable time for Lhe
purpose of administering or enforcing this Code.

1989 Vermont Fire Pievention and Building Code

Page 3




{chy Obtatn o construction permit from the
Commissioner or o duly authorized representative for
alt construction under Section 4{a) of this Code {or
public buildings or premises prier (o starting work at
the Building site,

() Oblain use and occapancy approvat from
the Commissioner or a duly authorized representalive
prior 1o any:

1) Occupancy of a building or part
(hereal after construction or alleration
of that building or part, or

23 Use of any building plant or equip-
ment on the premiscs, or

3) Change in the use and occupancy of
any building or part thereof,

SECTION 9.
POWERS OF THE
COMMISSIONER OF LABOR
AND INDUSTRY

The Commissioner of Labor and Industry or
a duly authorized representative may:

() Linter any public huilding or premise for
the purpose of administering or enlorcing this Code.

{h) In accordance with the provisions of 21
V.S.A Sce. 253, order a building or premise or any
part of it closed untif any unsafle condilion or viola-
tion of this Cede is corrected. Where appropriate the
Caommissioner may order the demolition, removal, or
fencing of any unsale building or premise,

(c) Cause a writien notice 1o be delivered to
the owner of any property dirccting him o correct
any condition where, in the opinion of the Commis-
sioner or o duly authorized representative, fhat
condilion constitutes a violation ol this Code.

() Order the owner Lo stop work on the
building ar premise il il is proceeding in contraven-
tion ol this Code or il it considered unsafle,

{e) Dircct that tests of maierials, devices, or
stroe i assenyblies be made, or suflicient evidence
or proot be submitied, at the expense ol the owner,
where the evidence or proof is necessary to determing

whether ihe material, device or construciion meets
the requirements of this Cade,

(D Revoke, amend, or refuse to issue a
permit where, in the opinion of the Commissioner or
a duly puthorized representative, the resulls of (ests
referred o in subscetion (¢) of this seclion are not
satisfactory.

{(g) Order the removal of any building or
equipment erected or placed in violation of this Coede.

{h) Conduct investigations and inspections
of any cxisting public building or premise in response
to any complaint regarding safety (o the public.

(i) Conduct routine, random, or regular
inspections of public buildings or premises based on
the relative risk to persons and property from fire of
particular types of premises.

(i) Pursnant 1o 21 V.§.A Scc. 256, enter into
agreements with municipalitics to enforce this Code.

SECTION 10.
ADOPTION OF NATIONALLY
RECOGNIZED SAFETY
STANDARDS

() The Commissioner of Labor and Indus-
try, for the purpose of making rules regarding the
construction of buildings, maintenance and operation
of premises, prevention of fires, removal of lire
hazards, and prescribing standards necessary (o
prolect the public, employees, and property againsi
harm arising out of or likely to arise out of fire,
adopts the lollowing nationaliy recognized safely
standards:

13 The BOCA National Building Code, 1987
edition and its T988 Supplement (herein
after noted as the BOCA Building Code),
except as amended, altered, deleted or added
lo in this Scction, shall apply o all construe-
tion, additions and alterations to alf public
huildings, and also to structural conditions
hazardous to life in all existing public
buitdings. To meet the individual necds of
Venmont, the BOCA Building Code is
amended as follows:

Note: These rules should be read in conjunction with.The
BOCA Natlonal Bullding Code, 1387 edition and lts
1988 supplement; The BOCA National Fire Preventlon
Code, 1987 editlon and lts 1988 supplement; and, The
Life Safety Code, 1988.

Page 4

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code



- delete - Section 100.  Scope
- delete - Section 101.  Applicability

- delete and replace as follows
- Section 103.2. Change in use

103.2 Change in Use: A change in use or occupancy without structural
alterations shall be subject to the provisions of the Life Safety Code.

- delete - Section 103.4. Rehabilitation

- delete and replace as follows
- Section 108.1 Professional, Architectural,
* and Engineering Services, when
required

108.1 Architectural and Engineering Services, when required: Accep-
tance or rejection by the Department of plans orspecilications submilted for
review is not intended to imply compliance or non-compliance with
Vermont licensing laws (26 V.S, A, Chapler 3 and 26 V.S.A. Chapter 20),
Where required by the size, height, use or complexily of the project and
where needed to insure the public safety, the Commissioner or a duly
authorized representative, may require that plans or engincering details be
submiticd by a licensed professional engineer or architect.

Examples of projects that may require plans to be submitted by a licensed
professional engineer or architect include;

a) hospitals,

by} schools,

c) jails, or

) public utilitics.
Examples of projects (hat may require engincering details to be submitled
by a licensed professional engincer include;

1) projects where mechanical systems carry hazardous materials,

2) mulii-story projects of steel and concrete construction, or

3) canopies supported by a single column.

These projects are listed solely as examples and are in no way intended to
limit the Commissioner’s authority to request that a licensed professional
engineeror architect submit more detailed plans where necded to insure the
public safety.

- delete - Section 109.1 Code Official

- delete - Section 109.2 Appointment

- delete - Section 109.3 Organization

- delete - Section 109.4 Deputy

- delete - Section 110.6  Rule making authority

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code Page 5




- delete and replace as follows
- Section 111.5 Plans and Specifications

111.5 Plans and specifications: The application for the permit shall be
accompanied by at least one copy of the specifications and plans drawn to
scale, with sufficient clarity and detail dimensions to show the nature and
character of the work to be performed. Additional copies of specifications
and plans shall be submitted upon request of the Commissioner or a duly
authorized representative.

- delete - Section 111.6.1 Private sewage disposal system
- delete - Section 112.5 Approved plans

- delete - Section 114.3 New construction and alteration
- delete - Section 114.3.1 Fee schedule

- delete - Section 114.4  Accounting

- delete - Section 114.5 Refunds

- delete - Section 115.2 Required inspections

- delete - Section 115.3  Final inspections

- delete - Section 117.4  Violation penalties

- delete - Section 118.2  Unlawful continuance

- delete - Section 120.2 Examination and record of dam-
aged structure

- delete - Section 122.4 Periodic inspections
- delete - Section 123 Board of Survey
- delete - Section 124 Means of Appeal

- delete and replace as follows
- Section 201 Mezzanines

201 Mezzanines: An intermediate level between the Roor and the ceiling
ol any room or space and covering not more than one third of the floor area
ol the room or space in which it is located.

- delete and replace as follows
- Section 304.1.1 Day care facilities

304.1.1 Day care facilities: A day care facility which provides care for
more than twelve persons more than two years of age for less than 24 hours
per day, is not otherwise classified as 1-2, and where children less than two
years of age are cared for onthe first story, shall be classified as Use Group
.

- delete and replace as follows
- Section 307.3.1 Child care facility
307.3.1 Child care facility: A child care facility which accommodates

more than five children less than two years of age shall be classified as Use
Group I-2.

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code - Page 6



- delete and replace as follows
- Section 309.4.1  Child care facilities

309.4.1 Child care facilities: A child care facility which accommodates
twelve or fewer children, is not otherwise classified as -2 and, where chil-
dren less than two years of age are cared for on the first story shall be
classified as Use Group R-3.

- amend in part

- Table 401 Fire resistance ratings of
structure elements

Tahle 401 Fire resistance ratings of structure elements

Replace the “0” hour fire rating requirement with a *1" hour fire rating
requirement on line 8, tenant spaces, for construction types 2C, 3B and 5B
and add “Note j. Structural members supporting fire resistance rated tenant
separations in buildings of types 2C, 3B, or 5B construction shall not be
required to be fire resistance rated uniess required by other provisions of this

Code.”
- delete and replace as follows
- Section 512 Physically handicapped and
aged

512 Physically handicapped and aged: Barrier Free access to Public
Buildings shall be provided for as required in the State of Vermont Rules
Governing Access to Public Buildings and Facilities by Persons with
Physical Disabilities - cffective §/17188.

- delete and replace as follows
- Section 605.2 Area limit

605.2 Area: The aggregate arca of a mezzanine or mezzanines within a
room or space shall not exceed one-third of the arca of that room or
space.

- delete - Section 623 Radio and television towers
- delete - Section 624 Radio and television antenna
- delete - Section 625 Swimming pools

- delete - Articie 7 interior Environmental Require-
ments

- new Section added
- Section 1004.1.1 Alternate Water Sprinkler Sys-
tems

1004.1.1 Alternate Water Sprinkler Systems: Waler sprinkler systems
for existing buildings requiring sprinkler protection due to a change in use
or allerations, that are of Use Group classification E, I-1, 1-2 Child Care
Facility, and R-1, and arc designed forless than 30 occupants, and buildings
of Use Group Classification R-2 and R-3 not greater than 4 stories in height
may install the water sprinkler system in uccordance with NFPA 13R, 1988
edition. '

{

1989 Vermont Iire Prevention and Building Code Page 7




- new Section added

= Section 1004.3.1

1004.3.1 Effcctive July 1, 1991, the required fire sprinkler system plans,
calculations, design, insiallation and testing shall be accomplished by a
person passing the examination for Level T cerlification for automatic
sprinklcr system layout from The National Institute for Certification in
Engingering Technologies.

- add new Section

- Section 1005.3.1
Section 1005.3.1 Effective July 1, 1991, limited area firc sprinkler
systems plans, caleulations, design, installation and testing shall be
accomplished by a person passing the examination for Level IT certifica-
tion for automatic sprinkler system fayout from the National Institute for
Certification in Enginecring Technologies.
- delete and replace as follows

- Section 1021.2 Where fire extinguishers are re-

quired

1021.2 Where fire extinguishers are required: Portable [ire extinguish-
ers shall be sclected, installed, located, inspected and maintained in accor-

dance with NFPA 10 listed in Appendix A, in all buildings and structures
subject to this Code,

- delete and replace as follows
- Section 1111.2  Ground snow loads

1111.2 Ground snow loads: Ground snow loads to be used in determining
the design snow loads forroofs are given on the map indicated as Appendix
L,

- add new soction
- Section 1111.4.1 Minimum snow load

1111.4.1 Minimum snoew load; The resultant flat roof snow load of p, shall
not be Tess than 40 psf.

- delete - Section 2103 Rat proofing

- delete and replace as follows
- Section 2500.2 Mechanical code

2500.2 Mechanical code: ATl mechanical equipment and systems shall be
construcled, instalicd and maintained in accordance with the BOCA Me-
chanical Code, Articles 2,3,4,6,8,9,10,11,12, 14,15 & 20.

- add new section
- Section 2500.3 Commercial cooking equipment

2500.3 Comnercial cooking equipment: All kilchen exhaust systems for
commercial cooking equipment shall be conslruciey, installed and main-
tained in accordance with NFPA 96 (1987 Edition) Standard for the
tnstallation of Bauipment for the Removal of Smoke and Grease Laden
Vapors [rom Commercial Cooking Equipment.

1989 Vermonit Fire Prevention and Building Code Page 8



- add new section
- section 2500.4 Instailation of fuel gas systems

2500.4 Installation of fuel gas systems: All fuel gas systems shall be
designed, constructed, installed and maintained in accordance with BOCA
Mechanical Code Articie 8. The provisions of NFPA 54, 1988 edition shall
apply when the provisions of BOCA Mechanical Code Article 8 does not
specifically cover conditions and operations.

- add new section
- Section 2500.4.1 Fuel gas instaliation

2500.4.1 Fuel gas installation: Effcctive July 1, 1991, all fucl gas instal-
Iations, repair and maintenance governed by this Code shall be accom-
plished by persons who have successfully completed the American Gas
Association course of study including “The Fundamentals of Combustion,
Gas Appliance Venting, Electricity, Gas Controls, and Gas Appliances.”

- delete and replace as foliows
- Section 2600.2 Referenced standard

2600.2 Referenced standard: The construction, alteration, maintenance,
operation, inspections, and test of elevators, escalalors, dumb-waiters,
moving walks, material 1ifts, wheelchair lifts and stairway chair lifis shall
conform to (ASME) ANSI A17.1. All references in this and other sections
of this Code to (ASME) ANST A17.1 listed in Appendix A shall be for the
1987 edition.

- delete - Section 2602.5.3 Manlifts

- delete and replace as follows

- Section 2605 Existing installations
2608 Existing installations: All existing installations shall be constructed,
altered, maintained, operated, inspected, and tested in accordance with
(ASME) ANSI A17.3 1986 edition. For clevators installed prior to Tanuary

1, 1956, the effective date for compliance with this Section shall be July 1,
1991.

- delete - Section 2613 Manlifts
- delete - Section 2614 Industrial lifts and loading

ramps

- delete - Section 2615 Automotive lifts

- delete - Section 2616.3 Machinery guards
- delete and replace as follows e

= Section 2700.1 Electrical wiring scope

2700.1 Electrical wiring scope: The provisions of this article shall control
the design and constroction of all new installations of electrical conductors,
equipment and systems in buildings or structures; and all alterations 10
existing wiring system therein to insure safety. All such installations shall
conform to the provisions of NFPA 70, The National Electrical Code, as
adopted by the Electricians’ Licensing Board.

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code Page 9



- delete - Section 2701.2.8 lllumination for toilets and
bathrooms

- delete - Section 2704.3  Annual permit
- delete - Section 2704.4  Annual records
- delete and replace as follows

- Articie 28 Plumbing systems

Article 28. Plumbing systems: The design and installation of plumbing
systems shatl be in accordance with the rules adopted by the Plumbers
Examining Board.

- delete - Article 29 Signs

materials; Section 3013.4 - Guardrails; Section 3014 -

Hazards; and, Section 3021 - Sanitation

- delete - Section 3002.2 - Unsafe equipment; Section .
3003.3 - Unsafe construction equipment; Section 3010.4 - -
Pedestrian walkways; Section 3011 - Removal of waste

Scaffolds: Section 3015 - Hoists; Section 3016.2-Ladders; .
Section 3018.3 - Steam boilers; Section 3019 - Health--"

sites shall be in accordance with the rules for occupational
safety and health, adopted by the Department of Labor and

Note: Where required, safety at building and construction |

industry (VOSHA).
- delete and replace as follows
- Article 31 Energy Conservation

Article 31. Energy Conservation: New publicly funded buildings, paid
for in whole or in part with lederal, state, or municipal monies, shall be
constructed to meet the standards for exterior envelope design contained
in Energy Conservation in New Building Design published by the
American Sociely of Heating, Refrigeration and Air Conditioning
Engincers (A.SH.R.AE 90-80) 1980, unless, as a condition of some
other state or local perinit, more stringent standards are requircd.

All plans for new publicly funded buildings shall contain an express
certilication that these standards will be met.

- delete and replace as follows
- Section 3200.1 Scope

3200.1 Scope: The commissioner may choose to apply the provisions of
this Article 1o allcrations, addilions, or changes 1o cxisling buildings,
without full compliance witl the provisions of the Vermont Fire Preven-
tion and Building Code of 1989 when, in the opinion of the Commissioner
there is not a distinet hazard to life or property. Unless the Commissioner
expressly authorizes the application of the Article, all other provisions of
the Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code of 1989 must be met.

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code

Page 10



- delete in part and replace as follows
- Appendix A

NIFPA #10 Portable Fire Extinguishers 1988 edition

- delete in part and replace as follows
- Appendix A

NFPA #11 Low Expansion Foam and Combined Agent Systems 1988
cdition,

- delete in part and replace as follows
- Appendix A

NFPA #12 Carbon Dioxide Extinguishing Systems 1988 edition,

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code Page 11




SECTION 10

ADOPTION OF NATIONALLY

RECOGNIZED SAFETY STAN-

DARDS - continued

2} The BOCA Naiionai Fire Prevention
Code, 1987 edilion and its 1988 Sup-

plement (hereinalter noted as the

ROCA Fiee Prevention Code), except
as amended, allered, deleted or added

to i this section shall apply to the

storage, handling or use of matcrials
and to conditions hazardons to Hle and

praperty in alf new and existing
buildings. To meet the individoal
needs of Vermont, the BOCA Fire
Prevention Code is amended as
follows:

- delete - Section F100.1

- delete - Section F101

- delete - Section F102.2

- deleie - Section F102.3

- delete - Section F102.4

- delete - Section F104

- delete - Section F105.3.2
- delete - Section F105.5

- delete - Section F105.5.1
! - delete - Section F301

- delete - Section F303.2

- gdelets - Section F305.2

- fdelete - Section F308.2.1

- Section F309.2

- delete in part
- Section F400.2

Title

Applicability

Inspections

Investigation of Fires

Fire Records

Means of Appeal

Unlawful continuance
Failure to correct violations
Penalty for violations

Open Burning

Permit required for removing
paint

Permit required for storage of

materials
Unauthorized seal removal

- delete and replace as follows

Hood Systems Suppression

173092 Hood Systems Supression: Each existing required commercial kitchen ex-
haust hood and duct system shall be protected with an approved aulomatic fire
suppression system inglalled in accordance with NFPA 96 (1987 edition).

Application of other codes
... plumbing ...

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code

Page 12



- delete - Section F1400.2 Permitrequiredforfumigation

and thermal insecticide
_ fogging
- delete - Article 16 Oil and gas production
- delete and replace as follows
- Section F1801.1 General fab areas

F1801.1 General fab areas: Fab areas in buildings and structures of niew

construction and those buildings and structures with a change of usc group

classification shall comply with the requirements of the building code listed

in Appendix A for H.P.M. use facililics.

- delete and replace as follows

- Section F1804.1  Existing buildings

F1804.1 Existing Buildings: When there are alterations or modifications

to existing fab arcas, transportation shall not be permitied in a means of

egress unless the means of cgress complies with Scction Fl 804.2 through

F1804.3 and Section 603.2 of the building code listed in Appendix A for

H.P.M, usc facilitics.

- add new section

- Section F1904.10 Automatic fire suppression

I'1904.10 Automatic Fire Suppression: An approved automatic suppres-

sion system shall be provided (o protect all self-service fuel dispensing

areas.

- delete - Section F2100.2 Permit required for junkyards

- delete - Section F2200.2 Permit required for welding
operations

- delete - Section F2300.2 Permit required for storage of
combustible fibers

- delete - Section F2500.2 Permit required for ctyogenic
liquids

- delete - Section F2600.2. Permitrequired for explosives

- delete - Section F2600.2.1 Prohibited permits for
explosives

- delete - Section F2600.3 Bond required for blasting
- delete - Section F2700.2 Permit required for fireworks

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code Page 13




! - add new sediion

' - Section ¥2800.1.1 Storage of flammable liquids
on farms and construction
projects and handling leak-
age from underground
storage tanks

F2800.1.1 Storage of Aammable liquids on farms and consiruciion

projects and handling leakage from underground storage tanks: The

Provisions of NFPA 329, 1987 edition and NFPA 3935, 1988 edition shall

apply when the provisions of this arlicle do not specilically cover condi-

tions and opcrations.

- delete - Section F2800.2 Permitrequired for hazardous
materials

- delete and replace as follows
- Section F3000.3 Record of installation

T3000.3 Record of installation: Installers shall maintain a record of all
installations [or which a permitis not required by Scetion F-3000.2 (butnot
including replacing of portable cylinders) and have it available for inspec-
tion by the Code official,

- add new section
- Section F3000.5 Installation of LP gas

I"3000.5 Installation of LP gas: Effective July 1, 1991, all LP gas
installation, repair and maintenance governed by this Code shall be com-
pleted by persons who have success(utly completed a related course of
study sponsorcd by the National Propane Gas Association and has received
the cerlification for installation and service technician from Murray State
Universily.

- delete in part and replace as follows
- Appendix A

NFPA 34 National Fuel Gas Code 1988 edilion

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code Page 14



SECTION 10. '
ADOPTION OF NATIONALLY
RECOGNIZED SAFETY STAN-
DARDS - continued

3) NFFPA 101, The Code for Safcty to Life
from Fire in Buildings and Structures 1988
edition (hereinalter noted as the Life Safety
Code), except as amended, altered, delcted
or added to in this Section shall apply to all
conditions affecting safety to life in new and
cxisting public buildings and shall apply Lo
the change of use of existing buildings. To
mecet the individual needs of Vermont, the
Life Safety Code is amended as [ollows:

- delete in part and replace as follows
-Section 7-7.1.1
Exception

7-7.1.1 Exception. NFPA 13R 1988 edition, may be used in
facilities having less than 30 occupants as required in Chap-
ters 11, 17, 20 and 21, and may be used where buildings are
not greater than four stories in height as required in Chapters
18,19, 22,

- delete and replace as follows
- Section 7-7.1.2
Limited Area Sprinklers.
7-7.1.2 Limited Avea Sprinklers. Sprinkler piping serving
not more than six sprinklers for any isolated hazardous area
may be connected directly to a domestic water supply system
havinga capacity sulTicient to provide 0. 15 gallon per minule
per square foot of loor arca throughout the eatire enclosed
arca, Shut off valves shatl nol be permitted in the sprinkler
system piping,
- delete in part
- Table 10-7.1.6.1 v
Height and Construction Limits for day
care centers for type “IlI (200)” and
(IV(OOO)!’
Delele the *“1 designation under “17 stories lor age group *“0
through 57
- delete and replace as follows
- Section 10-8.1.1.2
Group day care home.
10-8.1.1.2 Group day care home, The requirements detailed
in Section 10-8 are based on a minimum staff to client ratio of
two stall for up to 12 children with no more than 5 children
under age (wo.

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code Page 15



- delete in part
- Table 11-7.1.6.1
Height and Construction Limits for day
care centers for type “Il (200)” and
“V(000)”
Delete the 1 designation under “ 1" stories for age group 0
through 57
- delete in part
- Section 17-3.4.4
Detection, exception

- delete and replace as follows

- Section 20-3.1.1 exception
20-3.1.1 exception: In buildings three storics or less in
height, protected throughout by an approved automatic sprin-
ler system installed in accordance with Section 20-3.5.1,
unprotected vertical openings are permilted.

- delete and replace as follows

- Section 22-1.1.1 One and two family

dwellings
22-1.1.1 One and two family dwellings. This chapter estab-
lishes life salety requirements for all one- and two-family
dwellings. One- and two-lamily dwellings include buildings
containing not more than two dwelling units in which cach
living unit is occupicd by members of a single family withno
more than six outsiders, if any, accommodated in rented
rooms,

- delete in part and replace as follows
- Appendix B

NFPA #68 1988 Guide for Venting of Deflagrations.

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code

Page 16



SECTION 10.
ADOPTION OF NATIONALLY
RECOGNIZED SAFETY STAN-
DARDS - continued

(b) The term “Fire Official,” “Code Offi-
cial,” “Authority Having Jurisdiction™ and all similar
terms used in the BOCA Building Code, the BOCA
Fire Prevention Code and the Life Safety Code, shall
mean the Commissioner of Labor and Industry or
duly authorized representative. If the Commissioner
of Labor and Industry has assigned responsibility for
municipal enforcement pursuant to 21 V.8.A, Section
256, those similar terms shall be the qualified
official(s) appointed by the municipality to enforce
the rules and standards of this code.

{c) The deletion of certain articles and
Sections of the BOCA Building Code, the BOCA
Fire Prevention Code and the Life Safety Code has
bcen necessary Lo cnsure consistency with existing
repulatory authority. The failure to incorporate these
codes in their entirety should not be construed Lo
minimize the value of these Codes as effective
standards with current technolegy.

(d) The application of the BOCA Building
Code, the BOCA Fire Prevention Code and the Life
Safety Code has been designed to minimize conflicts
hetween the Codes, however, where conflicts occur
hetween the Codes in the arcas of egress, [ire protec-
tion sysicms and similar Life Safety requirements,
the standards of the Life Safety Code shall apply; and
where conflicts occur between the Codes in the area
of fite resistive construction, height and area limita-
tions, and similar buikding construction requirements,
the standards of the BOCA Building Code shall
apply.

(¢) Provisions and appendices which are
referred to in the adopted Articles, Sections and
Chaplters including the BOCA Mechanical Code,
1987 edition and its 1988 supplement, shall be
wtilized to the exlent necessary 1o clfectuate the
purpose of the adopted Articles, Sections and
Chapters, References in this Code to the BOCA
Building, Fire Prevention and Mechanical Codes
shall be to the 1987 edition and its 1988 supplement,

SECTION 11.
VARIANCE PROCEDURE

(a) The owner or a duly authorized represen-
tative may ask for a vartance from the requirements
of this Code as it applies to a public building er
premise, by submitling a request in wriling to the
Commissioner of Labor and Industry.

(b) The owner or a duly authorized represen-
tative shall submit the following when requesting a
variance:

13 Evidence that the propased or existing
building or premise is not in compli-
ance with the Code. A vartance
request will not be considered until
plan review or inspection procedures
have been completed by the Commis-
sioner or a duly authorized representa-
tive,

2) Bvidence that siricl compliance with
the Code could entail practical
difliculty, unnecessary hardship or is
otherwise unwarranted.

3) Evidence that the alternative proposcd
in licu of the Code will provide cyual
protection of the public safety as
provided by 1his Code. Properly
completed evaluations in accordance
with Article 32 of the BOCA Building
Code or NFPA 101M of the National
Fire Protection Association are
examples of supporting evidence.

(c) The Commisstoner may establish a
Variance Review Panel consisting of Department
stalf to review variance requests, pertaining to 21
V.S.A. Scction 252(¢).

(dy The Commissioner shall notily the
applicant in writing whether Lthe variance request has
been granted or denied and of any conditions atlached
thereto,

{c) A request for a variance relating 1o
access 1o a public building for the physically handi-
capped shall be referred for decision to the Architee-
tural Barrier Compliance Board established under
Title 21 V.S.A. Scctions 271-277.

1989 Vermont Firve Prevention and Building Code

Page 17



SECTION 12.
REQUEST FOR
RECONSIDERATION

(a) The owner or a duly authorized represen-
{ative may request a reconsideration by the Commis-
sioner where the applicant claims that the true intent
ol the Code or rules have been incorrectly interpreted
or the provisions of the Code do not fully apply.

(b) The applicant shall submit in writing the
precise issue 10 be reconsidered, relevant plans,
specifications, docimnents or any other arguments no
later than 15 {fifteen} days after receiving writlen
notification from the Department that violations of
the Code exist.

{(¢) The Commissioner shall issue a wrilten
decision within 30 days after receipt of the request
for reconsideration.

{d) A request for reconsideration shall in no
way relieve a person [rom complying with this Code
or any abatement previously set by the Department
unless the Commissioner expressly authorizes an
extension of abatement pending review of the request
lor reconsideration.

SECTION 13.
ADVISORY BOARD

{a) Any person may request an interpredation
of the application of this Cade by the Department as
it applies 1o using alternative or betler means of
canstruction, or aterials or equipment, by making a
reguiest i writing 1o the Commissioner of Labor and
Industry.

(b) The Commissioner of Lahor and
Industry may convene an Advisory Board to advise
the Commissioner on lechnica!l matters pertaining to
the interpretation.

(c) The Advisory Board shall consist of live
mermbers, one of whom shall be designated chairman
by the Commissioner. Each member shali be ap-
pointed by and serve at the pleasure of the Commis-
sioner; one member shall be a licensed professional
engineer, one shall be a licensed architect, one shall
be experienced in building construction and one shall
be an experienced fire service officer. The fifth
member shall represent the Fire Prevention Division
and supply support for the Advisory Board.

(@) A member of the Board shall not pass on
any question in which that member is engaged as
contraclor or material dealer, or in the preparation of
plans or specifications, or in which the member has
any personal interest,

{(2) Nothing coniained in this section shall be
construed to 1imit the authority of the Commissioner
of Labor and Industry to grant or deny variances or
exemptions pursuant to 21 V.5.A. Sec. 252 (e) and
these rules.

SECTION 14.
MUNICIPAL ENFORCEMENT
AND COORDINATION

() The Commissioner may assign the
responsibility for the enforcement of all or part of
these rules to a municipality which meets the
qualifications established in 21 V.5.A, Sec. 256.

{b) Where, pursuant to 21 V.5.A, Sec 256, a
municipality assumes responsibilily for the enforce-
ment of alt or a part of these roles that would be
subject to a fec for a construction permit (sce Scction
5) then the municipality may establish and collect
reasonable fees for its own use and no fec for a
construction permit will be charged for the benefit of
the State,

{c) The Commissioner may require informa-
tion {from any municipality regarding building
permits issued by the municipatity.

() A fire prevention and building code
adopted by any municipality shall be conststenl with
the standards adopted in Section 10 of these rules.

Page 18

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code



SECTION 15.
EFFECTIVE DATES

The 1983 Fire Prevention and Building
Code of the State of Vermont shall be repealed upon
the cffective date of these rules.

These rules shall take effect September 1,
1989 and shall be known as the 1989 Vermont Fire
Prevention and Building Code. Any building or
premise upon which construction or renovation was
begun within two years prior to the effective date of
this Code or for which plans, drawings or specilica-
tions were approved within three months of the
cffective daie of this Code and which was in compli-
ance with the 1983 Vermont Fire Prevention and
Building Code shall be considercd to be in compli-
ance with the requirements for new construction
under the 1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Build-
ing Code. Afler completion such buildings or
premises shall be maintained under the requirements
for existing buildings under the 1989 Vermont Fire
Prevention and Building Code.

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code

Page 19






Highyale

. 7 5

Swanlon . P N A W

Sl Albang EEEI I e R ) I . .
bane Cly . . : .

B, g
W C}
o, T - Falflald © o - -

'
Goorsla \ | L N Tt
Falrtag T 120
Ml en : .
"Wosflodd ©

e

Ecoex

inoaskl Cilyf © ~
dertchi
ih Burlliflon -

Witiialoa o

Burllngd

Richmbnd

Sholbutne

Charkatls §. . . . . o B ipeter
Mogipaliar Gy ™ T -
ainfetd pniaRsEELEEd oo. . o

Maoklon -

Farelebury

Vargernes Cily | ° ~ 11~

Panlon Waltham

Hewhavan
Addioon L.
wayaga®
Brdpsd | '} T
ﬁ\ .....
o - .
R T T TR e e e N A
Shoreham 'y 5 -
% Lelooslar Vibir e i I o o o - Stredlord f
B R Thellard
Orwstl _§-‘ ...........
FRR R 3 s e e N SR R
- Hepuich

Seneon | Hubbard:

Minimum Ground Snow

Wl —| B, e e e e e
Havan ég Caullslon E% ‘u\:\‘ ‘ . Loads
o ! (pounds per square foot)
Poolinay e, L Bniniibmosona e o o -
Hiddie .e. .
() 4P
i o i [ 40 pounds/square foot

Pawlal .} Banby

T . [ ] 50 pounds/square foot
80 pounds/square foot

70 pounds/square foot

Sandgale | Manchiasier

Building siles in mountainous areas may
require additional snow load design.

Sudarland

‘Adington

Shaftabury

* Dumener elon |

Bunnieglon

Bridlfobbro

Pawnal " Giinrd
Varnan







APPENDIX I

21 V.S.A, § 251a,

(a) As used in this subchapter “public building” means buildings owned or occupied by public
utilities, hospitals, schools, houses of worship, convalescent centers and homes for the aged, infirm or
disabled, nurseries, kindergartens and day cares; buildings in which pcople are employed, or occasionally
enter as part of their employment or are entertained, including private clubs and societies; cooperatives and
condominiums; buildings in which people rent accommodations, whether overnight or for a longer term;
restaurants, retail outlets, offices or office buildings, hotels, tents or other structures for public assembly,
including outdoor assembly, such as grandstands; buildings owned or occupied by the state of Vermont, a
county, amunicipality, a village or any public entity, including but not limited to a school or fire districi, Use
of any portion of a building in a manner described in this subscction shall make the entire building a “public
building” for purposes of this subsection. “Public building™ does notinclude an owner-occupicd single family
residence or an owner-occupied farm, unless used for a purpose described in this subsection or a lamily
residence registered as a day care home under chapter 34, subchapter 3 of Tille 33.

21 V.8.A. § 251d.
(d) Any condominium or multiple dwelling using a common roof, or row houses so-called,
whether any units are owned or leased or rented, shall be subject (o the rules promulgated under this chapler.

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code




tions.

ATTACHMENT |

Examples of information that should be included in the plans and specifica-

SITE PLANS SHOWING:

Building iocation

Distance from other nearby buildings
Building dimensions

Fire department access

COMPLETE CONSTRUCTION DRAWINGS SHOWING:

Building construction {(new and existing - all levels)
Exterior view of the building
Foundation information including strength of concrete
Wall, Floor and Ceiling construction
including cross sections and fire ratings
New and existing doors (construction, location, size, swing and rating)
New and existing windows (location, clear opening, size and dimensions)
Fire extinguisher locations and types
Ccecupant loads
Heating System information
(including type, name and model of heating units)

Exit signs - Egress lighting

Stair details and constiruction

Structural daia (inciuding roof and floor live loads)

Fire stopping - Draft stopping

Ventilalion systems including kitchen hood exhaust systems
Interior tinish fire ratings

Details indicating barrier free design for the physicaily disabled

PLANS MUST ALSO BE SUBMITTED FOR:

Elecirical systems
Sprinkier and other suppression systems
Fire alarm and detection systems

WORK NOTICES MUST ALSO BE SUBMITTED FOR:
Al electrical work
All plumbing work

1989 Vermont Fire Prevention and Building Code



State of Vermont

D :»;\\ Depariment of Labor and Industry CONSTRUCTION PERMIT APPLICATION
2, Frive Prevention Division
| Main Office - 120 State Street « Office Located at 7 Court 81, « Montpelier, VI 05602 Phone (802) 828-2106

Regional Qffices 269 North Main Street « Rutland, VI 05701 « Phone (802) 773-5867
Box 280 « Office Located at 40 Clinton St. « Springfield, VT 05156 « Phone (802) 885-5586
7 Ambrose Place < Burlington, VT 05401 » Phone (802) 638-21909

Building Site Information Fill Out Alt Requested Information fo Facilitate Review
Nama .
Address
Zip
Owner Information
Name
Address —
Zip
Occupancy Information
Describe Proposed Occupancy In Detall
BOCA Occupancy
RESIDENTIAL OCCUPANCY - Numberof Units —— Number of Units Having Handicapped Access
Construction Information
Type of Construction o
- ?oncombusuble Noncombustible/Combustible Combuslible (Wood Frame)
Type 1 - Type 2 Type 3 Typed Type 5
I;rc;;ecled Protected Ml;;;:rolecled Protected Unprotecled Heavy Tlmber| Protected Unprotected
1A 1B 2A 2B 2C 3A 3B 4 S5A | 5B
Type of Construction - e
Total Stjuare Footage of Largest Story:
Number of Stories: — . Total Square Footage:
Proposed Fire Protection Systems
Fire Alarm: | | Manual | | automatic || Smoke Detectors
Sprinkler: || Complele (J Limited [] Nohe
Standpipe: [l Yes |j No Other: .
Water Supply Information
Public Water Supply: | | Yes [} No GPM PSI
Publie Sewear: [_J Yes | 1 No




State of Vermont - Department of Labor and Industry CONSTRUCTION PERMIT APPEICATION

Fire Prevention Division

Project Information

This section must be completed for all Aiteration and Renovation projects.

{1 New Bullding
” A. Falr Market Value of the building:

[ Addition

D Renovation/Alteration
D Repalr/Replacement
D Fuel Tanks

l_] Equipment

B. Method of appraisal
D Tax Assessment

tion.)

EJ Flre Suppression System value?

|| Kitchen Hood . | Jves [ ] no

[:J Independent Appralsal by a certifled appralser (attach copy of appralsal to applica-

- C. Does the cost of alteration, less the cost of reroofing, Interlor decaration, changes to me-
U Fire Alarm System chanlcal and electrical systems, and normal maintenance, exceed 40% of the fair marke.

Contractor and Architect Information

Project Contractor Name: Telephone — .
Address

Praject Enginger or Architect Name: - Telephone

Address ...

Project Cost Information

a. Costof Building Construcuon...................T$. T Nearest cflur - Oyt Centia
Cost of Equipment, etc. belng installed...... .-

ROOTING ..ot
Interior DeCoraliNg. ..o
EIBCHHCAL e
PIUMBIAG .ot e
Fire Suppression system.......cn
Heating, air conditioning........ccooeeicaniis

~ o ooz

Fire AIrm SYSIBM.. ..o o o

Other Pemmit fee is based on the total valuation of improvement

TOTAL VALUE OR IMPROVEMENT $ ¥0.003 = Construction Permit Fee

Other Information

Signature of Applicant ' Date

Anticipated Starting Date of Constructlon ... Anticipated Completion Date ... —————— .

PLANS REVIEW RECORD - For Office Use Only - Do Not Write Below This Line

Lifs Tap.| Plans Review Data Plans Cate Plang .
She Number Critoria Fea Recaived By Reviewed By Hetes




